Bid Tabulation Report from Carson City Purchasing & Contracts
775-283-7137

http://www.carson-city.nv.us/index.aspx?page=998

Notice to Contractors Bid# 1011-073 Carson City Public Works Solar Photovoltaic System

Date and Time of Opening: July 30, 2010 at 11:10 am

Description Bidder # 1 Bidder # 2 Bidder # 3
Bombard Electric,
Reliant Electric System 3, Inc. LLC
BONDING Provided, $, %, or no Cashiers Check 5% 5%
PREFERENTIAL Bidder Status N/A N/A N/A
BIDDER acknowledges receipt addendums 1 1 0
Description Sched] Unit | Unit price | Total price |Unit pricej Total Price] Unit |Total Price
Value Price
1 Mobilization, Demobilization and Clean-up 1 LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00] $12,800.00] $12,800.00] $6,099.00 $6,099.00
2 230 Watt Solar PV Panels 544 EA $590.00] $320,960.00 $510.60] $277,766.40 $779.00 $423,m
3 135 KW Inverter 1 EA $65,076.00 $65,076.00] $85,760.00] $85,760.00] $66,045.00 $66,045.00
4 Racking System 1 LS $40,000.00 $40,000.00] $42,000.00 $42,000.00] $20,113.00 $20,113.00
5 Data Acquisition System 1 EA $12,000.00 $12,000.00] $17,500.00] $17,500.00] $13,510.00 $13,510.00
6 Shaded Inverter Enclosure and Bollards 1 EA $8,150.00 $8,150.00] $17,397.00 $17,397.00] $15,229.00 $15,229.00
7 Electrical Conduit and Wiring 1 LS $21,750.00 $21,750.00] $32,100.00] $32,100.00] $64,022.00 $64,022.00
8 Other Material 1 LS $10,000.00 $10,000.00] $38,000.00 $38,000.00 $3,752.00 $3,752.00
9 Electrical Labor 1 LS $71,794.00 $71,794.00] $89,485.00] $89,485.00] $95,184.00 $95,184.00
10 |Other Labor 1 LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00] $33,982.00] $33,982.00 $336.00 $336.00
Total Bid Price: $559,730.00 $646,790.40 $708,066.00
Alternate Add Pricing
Inverter Extended Warranty of 10 Years 1 LS In Base Bid] $0.00 No Bid $0.00] $4,567.00 $4,567.00
Inverter Extended Warranty of 20 Years 1 LS $14,000.00 $14,000.00 No Bid $0.00] $8,677.00 $8,677.00
Annual Solar Panel and Wiring Maintenance Services 1 Year $4,500.00 $4,500.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
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Total Bid Price written in words? y/n Yes Yes Yes
Bidder Information provided? y/n Yes Yes Yes
Sub Contractors listed? y/n or none Yes None Yes
Bid Document executed? y/n Yes Yes Yes

END OF DOCUMENT

***  Mathematical Error in Bid
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